Final bid Tabulation
ITB 130231 - Purchase of Fire Retardent Uniforms

Hudson WorkWear Co. Gresco Electric Supply Inc. Summit Safety, LLC Stuart C Irby
Brecksville, OH Wildwood, FL Tampa, FL Dade City, FL Orlando, FL
Item Description QTY | Unit Cost |[Extended Cost| Unit Cost [Extended Cost Unit Cost [Extended Cost| Unit Cost |[Extended Cost|Unit Cost| Extended Cost
Tee Shirt 141 $36.00 $5,076.00 No Bid No Bid $48.05 $6,775.05 $39.14 $5,518.74 $26.72 $3,767.52
Tee Shirt - Larger Sizes 48 $38.00 $1,824.00 No Bid No Bid $58.15 $2,791.20 $41.10 $1,972.80 $34.74 $1,667.52
Henley short sleeve t-shirt
with pocket 141 $83.50 $11,773.50 | $64.40 $9,080.40 $89.45 $12,612.45 $79.20 $11,167.20 | $59.00 $8,319.00
Henley short sleeve t-shirt
with pocket - Larger Sizes 48 $100.00 $4,800.00 $77.25 $3,708.00 | $107.30 $5,150.40 $100.99 $4,847.52 $73.75 $3,540.00
Long sleeve Henley 141 $51.00 $7,191.00 $43.49 $6,132.09 $61.50 $8,671.50 $54.03 $7,618.23 $40.26 $5,676.66
Long sleeve Henley -
Larger Sizes 48 $61.00 $2,928.00 $52.19 $2,505.12 $73.75 $3,540.00 $65.56 $3,146.88 $50.33 $2,415.84
Long Sleeve Button Up Shil 141 $87.00 $12,267.00 No Bid No Bid $74.90 $10,560.90 $88.76 $12,515.16 $64.45 $9,087.45
Long Sleeve Button Up
Shirts - Larger sizes 48 $104.00 $4,992.00 No Bid No Bid $90.55 $4,346.40 $106.50 $5,112.00 $83.80 $4,022.40
Denim Pants 141 $52.00 $7,332.00 No Bid No Bid $69.30 $9,771.30 $48.36 $6,818.76 $39.36 $5,549.76
Denim Pants - Larger Sizes| 48 $65.00 $3,120.00 No Bid No Bid $83.85 $4,024.80 $60.44 $2,901.12 $49.20 $2,361.60
Zipper Front Sweatshirt 28 $123.00 $3,444.00 | $104.88 | $2,936.64 | $131.90 $3,693.20 $116.84 $3,271.52 $87.05 $2,437.40
Zipper Front Sweatshirt -
Larger Sizes 6 $147.00 $882.00 $125.80 $754.80 $158.70 $952.20 $140.21 $841.26 $108.82 $652.92
Embroidered Logo - FR
thread 1 $0.00 $0.00 $6.00 $6.00 $5.95 $5.95 $4.50 $4.50 $12.00 $12.00
One time setup fee 1 $0.00 $0.00 $95.00 $95.00 $60.00 $60.00 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00 $65.00
Screen print logo 1 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 $2.00 $2.50 $2.50 $12.00 $12.00
One time setup fee 1 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $65.00 $65.00
Price for initial sizing 1 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $65,629.50 $25,218.05 $72,957.35 $65,738.19 $49,652.07




