FINAL BID TABULATION
ITB 130121 - TREE TRIMMING AND LINE CLEARING

ABC Professional Tree Services, Inc.

Lewis Tree Service

. Extended Cost Extended Cost
Item . L. Estimated . . . . .
No Bid Item Description Quantit Unit  |Regular Time| Overtime Based on Regular Time| Overtime Based on
v Unti Cost | Unit Cost| Regular Time Unti Cost | Unit Cost [ Regular Time
HOURLY CREW - Includes all 1
1 . ficiudes all persofine 2000 | SRe8 | ¢10774 | s16161 | $215480.00 $84.49 | $161.61 | $168,980.00
and equipment. Time
FOOTAGE / RIGHT OF WAY CREW
2 |- Includes all personnel and equipment. 270,000 LF $1.65 $2.48 $445,500.00 $0.75 $2.48 $202,500.00
SUPERVISOR/FOREPERSON
3 / 2,000 H;S Reg | ¢32.00 $48.00 |  $64,000.00 $27.56 $48.00 | $55,120.00
ime
COST OF UNDERBRUSH TREE REMOVAL
4 |Removal of 4" to 12" Tree 60 Each $65.00 $65.00 $3,900.00 $25.00 $65.00 $1,500.00
5 |Removal of 12" to 18" Ttree 48 Each $150.00 $150.00 $7,200.00 $250.00 $150.00 $12,000.00
6 |Removal of 18" to 24" Tree 14 Each $300.00 $300.00 $4,200.00 $502.00 $300.00 $7,028.00
TOTAL COST CORE TOTAL COST CORE
e $740,280.00 e $447,128.00
PERSONNEL
7 CREW LEADER $29.71 S44.57 $24.04 S44.57
8 BUCKET TRIMMER $27.34 $41.01 $22.68 $41.01
9 CLIMBER TRIMMER $27.34 $41.01 $22.68 S41.01
10 GROUNDSMAN $20.98 $31.47 $18.58 $31.47
11 EQUIPMENT OPERATOR $29.71 $44.57 $22.68 S44.57
12
INJECTION ,SERVICE,MAN $31.71 S47.57 $24.04 S47.57
(Herbicide Applicator)
EQUIPMENT
13
47.00 47.00 23.00 47.00
BUSH HOG - 66-10, 55HP, 6 FOOT CUT > > > »
14 CHIPPER $4.25 $4.25 $4.00 S4.25
15 STUMP GRINDER/REMOVER $7.00 $7.00 $12.00 $7.00
16 KERSHAW TYPE HEAVY BRUSH OR TREE $75.00 £75.00 £32.80 £75.00
REMOVER/MOWER ' ' ’ ’
17 AERIAL BUCKET TRUCK $16.95 $16.95 $14.50 $16.95
This tabulation has been reviewed and approved by
the Purchasing Manager. Page 10F 4




FINAL BID TABULATION
ITB 130121 - TREE TRIMMING AND LINE CLEARING

ABC Professional Tree Services, Inc.

Lewis Tree Service

. Extended Cost Extended Cost
Item ] . Estimated ] . . . .
No Bid Item Description Quantit Unit  |Regular Time| Overtime Based on Regular Time| Overtime Based on
v Unti Cost | Unit Cost| Regular Time Unti Cost | Unit Cost [ Regular Time
18 BUCKET TRUCK W/DUMP BED $27.00 $27.00 $14.10 $27.00
19 SPLIT DUMP TRUCK|  $14.50 $14.50 $8.00 $14.50
20 CHIPPER TRUCK]| $13.24 $13.24 $9.50 $13.24
21 SPRAY TRUCK $14.50 $14.50 $9.70 $14.50
22 TREE GROWTH RETARDANT No Bid No Bid $154.31 $163.00
Arbor Systems
_ J&E J&E . .
Desribe System used here Direct Inject
ADDITIONAL LINEAR FOOT SERVICES
23 BUSH HOGGING — PER LINEAR FOOT $2.00 $3.00 $0.25 $0.25
24 GROWTH RETARDANT SPRAYING — PER LINEAR $2.00 $3.00 $0.18 $0.18

This tabulation has been reviewed and approved by
the Purchasing Manager.
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FINAL BID TABULATION
ITB 130121 - TREE TRIMMING AND LINE CLEARING

Evergreen Tree Service

The Davey Tree Expert Company

Item . o Estimated - . . Extended Cost Regular . Extended Cost
No Bid Item Description Quantity Unit Regul..elr Time Ov?rtlme Based on T1.me OV.el‘tlme Based on Regular
Unti Cost Unit Cost [ Regular Time | Unti Cost | Unit Cost Time
1 HOURLY CREW - Includes all personnel 2,000 Hr.s Reg $125.00 $207.00 $250,000.00 $88.27 $207.00 $176,540.00
and equipment. Time
FOOTAGE / RIGHT OF WAY CREW
2 |- Includes all personnel and equipment. 270,000 LF $1.10 $197.00 | $297,000.00 $1.16 | $197.00 $313,200.00
3 SUPERVISOR/FOREPERSON 2,000 H_II’_iSnlj:g $36.80 $43.91 $73,600.00 $42.60 $43.91 $85,200.00
COST OF UNDERBRUSH TREE REMOVAL
4 |Removal of 4" to 12" Tree 60 | Each $25.00 $1,500.00 $114.75 | $145.10 $6,885.00
5 |Removal of 12" to 18" Tree 48 | FEach $150.00 No Bid $7,200.00 $132.41 | $159.09 $6,355.68
6 |Removal of 18" to 24" Tree 14 Each $262.00 $3,668.00 $176.55 | $205.72 $2,471.70
TOTAL COST CORE TOTAL COST
rrens| $632,968.00 CORB 1TEMs| $590,652.38
PERSONNEL
7 CREW LEADER $23.10 $36.80 $27.44 $37.04
8 BUCKET TRIMMER $20.27 $27.15 $22.54 $30.43
9 CLIMBER TRIMMER $24.50 $29.40 $23.03 $31.09
10 GROUNDSMAN $19.90 $28.10 $18.62 $25.14
11 EQUIPMENT OPERATOR $49.50 $68.11 $27.44 $37.04
12 INJECTION ,SERVICE,MAN $39.27 $61.22 $23.03 $31.09
(Herbicide Applicator)
EQUIPMENT
13
BUSH HOG - 66-10, 55HP, 6 FOOT CUT 590.25 »20.22
14 CHIPPER $4.23 $4.98
15 STUMP GRINDER/REMOVER $19.94 $9.98
16 KERSHAW TYPE HEAVY BRUSH OR TREE
REMOVER/MOWER| ~ $125:00 SAE
No Bid No Bid
17 AERIAL BUCKET TRUCK $39.80 $14.35
This tabulation has been reviewed and approved by
the Purchasing Manager. Page 3 0F 4




FINAL BID TABULATION
ITB 130121 - TREE TRIMMING AND LINE CLEARING

Evergreen Tree Service

The Davey Tree Expert Company

Item . o Estimated . . . Extended Cost Regular . Extended Cost
No Bid Item Description Quantity Unit Regulfﬂu— Time Ov.erume Based on T1.me OV.el‘tlme Based on Regular
Unti Cost | Unit Cost | Regular Time | Unti Cost | Unit Cost Time
18 BUCKET TRUCK W/DUMP BED $39.80 $14.35
19 SPLIT DUMP TRUCK $19.25 $8.06
20 CHIPPER TRUCK]|  $24.35 $8.06
21 SPRAY TRUCK $16.61 $9.55
22 TREE GROWTH RETARDANT|[  $500.00 $2.15
Desribe System used here
ADDITIONAL LINEAR FOOT SERVICES
23 BUSH HOGGING - PER LINEAR FOOT $1.35 No Bid $0.25 No Bid
24 GROWTH RETARDANT SPRAYING — PER LINEAR $1.45 $0.16
This tabulation has been reviewed and approved by
the Purchasing Manager. Page 4 OF 4




