City of Leesburg, Florida

ITB 130281 - Aquatic Vegetation Removal

March 11, 2013

Final Bid Tabulation 2:00 PM
Professional
Earth Balance Clarke Waterfront Clean-up Deangelo Applied Aquatics
. Parks & Recreation
Bid Item -
Location Inspect Treat Inspect Treat Inspect Treat Inspect Treat Inspect Treat

1 Stormwater Park $25.00 $45.00 $20.00 $130.00 | $20.00 $75.00 $25.00 $42.00 $52.00 $52.00
2 Lake William & Mary $25.00 $63.00 $20.00 $130.00 | $20.00 $100.00 $25.00 $150.00 $95.00 $95.00
3 Fountain Lake Park $25.00 $28.00 $20.00 $50.00 | $20.00 $50.00 $25.00 $65.00 $28.00 $28.00
4 Venetian Gardens $25.00 $116.00 $20.00 $200.00 | $20.00 $165.00 $25.00 $32.00 $85.00 $85.00
5 Ski Beach $25.00 $47.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $165.00 $25.00 $46.00 $76.00 $76.00
6 Herlong Park $25.00 $58.00 $20.00 $180.00 | $20.00 $75.00 $25.00 $78.00 $66.00 $66.00
7 Singletary Park $25.00 $64.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $75.00 $25.00 $63.00 $66.00 $66.00
7A Marina $25.00 $52.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $50.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00

MONTHLY COST| $200.00 $473.00 | $160.00 $990.00 | $160.00 $755.00 $200.00 $501.00 $493.00 $493.00

TOTAL BOTH SERVICES $673.00 $1,150.00 $915.00 $701.00 $986.00
Environmental Services

8 Lake Lucerne $25.00 $43.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $85.00 $25.00 $100.00 $85.00 $85.00
9 Lake Lorraine $25.00 $170.00 $20.00 $250.00 | $20.00 $75.00 $25.00 $315.00 $71.00 $71.00
10 Little Lake Lorraine $25.00 $24.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $50.00 $25.00 $59.00 $45.00 $45.00
11 Lake Maitland $25.00 $16.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $50.00 $25.00 $31.00 $30.00 $30.00
12 Dyches Lake $25.00 $145.00 $20.00 $110.00 | $20.00 $300.00 $25.00 $350.00 $330.00 $330.00
13 Scenic Street Pond $25.00 $98.00 $20.00 $120.00 | $20.00 $60.00 $25.00 $110.00 $47.00 $47.00
14 Indian Lane Pond $25.00 $106.00 $20.00 $145.00 | $20.00 $50.00 $25.00 $70.00 $35.00 $35.00
15 Nursery Road Pond $25.00 $54.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 $15.00 $15.00
16 Flamingo Drive Pond $25.00 $44.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $80.00 $25.00 $98.00 $80.00 $80.00
17 Lake Hollywood $25.00 $185.00 $20.00 $110.00 | $20.00 $150.00 $25.00 $451.00 $137.00 $137.00
18 Louis Street Pond $25.00 $31.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $75.00 $25.00 $74.00 $80.00 $80.00
19 Park Lake $25.00 $23.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $40.00 $25.00 $48.00 $30.00 $30.00
20 Balmoral Circle Pond $25.00 $10.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $30.00 $25.00 $22.00 $20.00 $20.00
21 Lake Robin Hood $25.00 $55.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $75.00 $25.00 $129.00 $57.00 $57.00
22 Chester Street Pond $25.00 $18.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $40.00 $25.00 $29.00 $30.00 $30.00
23 mcCormack Pond $25.00 $53.00 $20.00 $155.00 | $20.00 $100.00 $25.00 $78.00 $80.00 $80.00
24 Lake Bonaire $25.00 $18.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $40.00 $25.00 $68.00 $30.00 $30.00
25 DOT Pond $25.00 $14.00 $20.00 $100.00 | $20.00 $25.00 $25.00 $32.00 $25.00 $25.00
26 Pepper Tree Pond $25.00 $55.00 $20.00 $110.00 | $20.00 $75.00 $25.00 $34.00 $66.00 $66.00

MONTHLY COST $475.00 $1,162.00| $380.00 | $2,200.00 | $380.00 | S$1,425.00 S$475.00 | $2,123.00 | $1,293.00 | $1,293.00

TOTAL BOTH SERVICES $1,637.00 $2,580.00 $1,805.00 $2,598.00 $2,586.00




City of Leesburg, Florida

ITB 130281 - Aquatic Vegetation Removal

March 11, 2013

Final Bid Tabulation 2:00 PM
Professional
Earth Balance Clarke Waterfront Clean-up Deangelo Applied Aquatics
GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE $2,310.00 $3,730.00 $2,720.00 $3,299.00 $3,572.00
Local Vendor Tier | (5%) $0.00 $0.00 $136.00 $0.00 $0.00
Local Vendor Tier Il (2%) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ESTIMATED ANNUAL COST $27,720.00 $44,760.00 $32,640.00 $39,588.00 $42,864.00
LVP Adjusted Annual $27,720.00 $44,760.00 $31,008.00 $39,588.00 $42,864.00
Difference from Low Bidder $0.00 $17,040.00 $3,288.00 $11,868.00 $15,144.00
AQUATIC HERBICIDE PRICING
Product Description UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE UNIT BID PRICE
Rodeo GL $25.99 GL $32.58 GL $23.44 GL $40.60 GL $30.76
Hydrothol 191 GL $72.97 GL $132.80 GL $82.78 GL $91.00 GL $78.99
Hydrolthol 191 granular LB $3.26 LB $6.62 LB $3.50 LB $4.20 LB $3.63
Chelated Copper LB $1.72 GL $45.88 LB S1.74 GL $36.40 LB $1.89
Aquathol K GL $71.34 GL $128.96 GL $80.48 GL $86.80 GL $76.16
Aquathol Super K LB $18.54 LB $33.12 LB $20.64 LB $23.80 LB $20.11
Garlon 3 GL $66.89 GL $149.88 GL $92.50 GL $22.40 GL $86.43
Garlon 4 GL $60.39 GL $167.74 GL $99.38 GL $31.87 GL $98.44
2,4 D Amine GL $18.65 GL $32.20 GL $20.84 GL $22.40 GL $18.14
LV6 (2,4D ester) No Bid No Bid No Bid GL $37.10 GL $42.03
LV4 (2,4D ester) No Bid No Bid No Bid GL $34.30 GL $61.49
Reward GL $88.76 GL $158.00 GL $62.50 GL $134.40 GL $97.21
Aguashade GL $40.45 GL $63.78 GL $50.00 GL $57.40 GL $41.09
HERBICIDES NOT LISTED
Refuge (slyphosate GL $36.28 QT (Sonar) | $623.00
Tribune (diquat GL $104.00
Hardball closest to LV4/6 GL $35.95
Copper Sulfate (Fine) LB $1.57
Turf Trax Blue GL $30.33
Manual/Physical Removal Hour $200.00 Hour | $100.00 Hour | $198.00 Hour | $200.00 Hour | $220.00




