80171 - Pool Chemicals
Initial Bid Tabulation
Due Date: January 25, 2008

Custom Controls Davis Supply Leslie's Poolmart Poolsure Spies Pool LLC
Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly
Item Estimated Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
No Description Unit Quantity |Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
Gallon | 3000 gallons
1 |Liquid Chlorine (bulk) [per month $ 1.05| $3,150.00{$% 1.05]$ 3,150.00 No Bid NoBid |$ 1.20($3,600.00 |[$ 1.39($4,170.00
84-15 gallon
2 [Muriatic Acid Gallon |vats per year No Bid NoBid |[$ 45.00|$ 315.00 |$ 52.68 (% 368.76 [$ 47.00($ 329.00 [$ 39.95|$ 279.65
2 - 50 Ib bags
3 [Sodium Bicarbonate Bag |per month No Bid NoBid [$ 14.00|$ 28.00|%$ 14.14|$ 28.28|$ 13.50($ 27.00|$ 14.95(%$ 29.90
8 - 50 Ib bags
4 |Diatomaceous Earth Bag |per month No Bid NoBid [$ 20.00($ 160.00 |$ 11.98($ 9584 |$ 19.75($ 158.00 [$ 19.95($ 159.60
1-100 Ib. bag
5 [Stabiliizer Bag |per month No Bid NoBid [$ 80.00[$ 80.00|$% 93.20($ 93.20|$ 85.00($ 85.00|% 99.00$ 99.00
1-50 Ib bag
6 [Calcium Bag |per month No Bid NoBid [$ 16.00|$ 16.00|$ 17.99|$ 1799 |$ 1850 (% 1850 |$ 19.95(% 19.95
3 gallons per
7 |Algaecide Gallon |month No Bid NoBid [$ 72.00|$ 216.00 |$ 544(|$ 16.32|$ 1500($ 4500 |$% 9.95|($% 29.85
Monthly Cost $ 3,150.00 | $ 3,965.00 | $ 620.39 | $ 4,262.50 | $ 4,787.95
Yearly Cost ( Monthly X12) $ 37,800.00 | $ 47,580.00 | $ 7,444.68 | $ 51,500.00 | $ 57,455.40




