
Office Products Core Item Pricing Comparison

SKU No. Item Description UOM Qty*

Capital 
Office 

Products 
 Extended 

Cost 
Ernie Morris 
Enterprises

Extended
Cost

bx 150  $          0.49 $        73.50 0.99$           $      148.50 
bx 200  $          0.09 $        18.00 0.11$           $        22.00 
bx 100  $          0.25 $        25.00 0.29$           $        29.00 
bx 150  $          0.19 $        28.50 0.24$           $        36.00 
bx 100  $          0.04 $          4.00 0.05$           $          5.00 
ea 150  $          0.79 $      118.50 1.56$           $      234.00 
pk 30  $        18.99 $      569.70 28.12$         $      843.60 
ea 50  $          0.24 $        12.00 0.25$           $        12.50 
bx 50  $          6.99 $      349.50 7.49$           $      374.50 
ea 40  $          0.99 $        39.60 no bid $        39.60 
bx 100  $          4.89 $      489.00 4.99$           $      499.00 
bx 450  $          7.99 $   3,595.50 9.49$           $   4,270.50 
bx 400  $          8.59 $   3,436.00 8.90$           $   3,560.00 
bx 60  $          5.75 $      345.00 7.45$           $      447.00 
bx 60  $          4.79 $      287.40 5.85$           $      351.00 
bx 200  $        21.99 $   4,398.00 25.50$         $   5,100.00 
bx 200  $        23.99 $   4,798.00 28.00$         $   5,600.00 
bx 200  $        27.99 $   5,598.00 32.00$         $   6,400.00 
pk 200  $          0.69 $      138.00 1.00$           $      200.00 
pk 200  $          0.69 $      138.00 0.99$           $      198.00 
pk 50  $          5.99 $      299.50 5.99$           $      299.50 
dz 100  $          0.39 $        39.00 3.84$           $      384.00 
bx 100  $        12.99 $   1,299.00 18.90$         $   1,890.00 
bx 100  $        12.99 $   1,299.00 19.47$         $   1,947.00 
tb 30  $          0.54 $        16.20 no bid $        16.20 
dz 60  $          6.99 $      419.40 7.89$           $      473.40 
dz 60  $          6.99 $      419.40 7.89$           $      473.40 
dz 60  $        10.99 $      659.40 11.49$         $      689.40 
dz 60  $        10.99 $      659.40 11.49$         $      689.40 
dz 16  $        14.59 $      233.44 15.49$         $      247.84 
ea 100  $          0.35 $        35.00 0.50$           $        50.00 
ea 125  $          0.49 $        61.25 0.51$           $        63.75 

MMM2027 3M Post-it Bright Colors Memo Cube ea 100  $          2.99 $      299.00 3.23$           $      323.00 
UNV-35668 UNIVERSAL Post-it Plain Canary Yellow Notes pk 150 3.29$          $      493.50 5.99$           $      898.50 
TOP4002 Tops Carbonless While You Were Out Book ea 50  $          1.59 $        79.50 1.72$           $        86.00 

TOP74890 Tops Second Nature Recycled Perforated Top Pad 
TOP74910 Tops Second Nature Recycled Perforated Top Pad 

Tops Second Nature Recycled Perforated Top Pad 

UNV-07071 UNIVERSAL Permanent Sharpie Fine Point Marker 
SAN13601 

unv-80102 UNITED Dennison Address Labels 
unv-80107 UNITED Dennison Address Labels 

TOP74840 

Sanford Fine Industrial Marker 

SMD64600 Smead Permalon Vinyl 1/5 Cut Hanging Folder Tabs 
AVE98189 Avery Dennison Hi-Liter Bonus Pack 

Tops Second Nature Recycled Perforated Top Pad 
TOP74880 Tops Second Nature Recycled Perforated Top Pad 

PENC505HB Pentel Super Hi-Polymer Lead 
TOP74830 

SMD73805 Smead Easy-Access Top Tab File Pocket 
SMD73810 Smead Easy-Access Top Tab File Pocket 
SMD64615 Smead 1/3 Cut Vinyl Hanging Folder Tabs 

cop-823000 CAPITAL Manila File Folder 
unv-15115 UNIVERSAL Manila File Folder 

AVE07742 Avery Dennison Hi-Liter Desk Style Highlighter 

unv-14113 UNIVERSAL Hanging Folder with Tabs 
SMD73800 Smead Easy-Access Top Tab File Pocket 

 48X CD-R Media 
QUA37890 Quality Park Gummed Clasp Envelope 
PAP85822 Paper Mate Erase-It Advance Eraser Stick 
SPR08890 Sparco Heavy-Duty Clasp Envelope 

 Correction Film 

SPR87005 Sparco Binder Clips 
ACC72580 ACCO Economy Paper Clips 

cop-8923000 CAPITAL Hanging Folder with Tabs 

ivr-77815  48X CD-R Media 
ccs-72201

SPR87010 Sparco Binder Clips 
SPR87002 Sparco Binder Clips 

ACC72380 ACCO Economy Paper Clips 
int-60232

* Quantities are estimated only and used for comparison/evaluation purposes.
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AMP25093 Ampad Pocket Size Memo Notebook ea 600  $          0.61 $      366.00 0.69$           $      414.00 
TOP74111 Tops Second Nature 1-Subject Notebook ea 150 1.99$          $      298.50 2.15$           $      322.50 
UNV-35600 UNIVERSAL Plain Paper Easel Pad ct 30 14.99$        $      449.70 no bid $      449.70 
AMP24028 Ampad Evidence Recycled Easel Pad ct 20 21.99$        $      439.80 24.99$         $      499.80 
TOP7288 TOPS  Adding Machine Rolls pk 50 2.99$          $      149.50 4.99$           $      249.50 
PAP12132 Paper Mate American Classic Pencil dz 20 0.79$          $        15.80 no bid $        15.80 
PAP12242 Paper Mate Earthwrite Recycled Pencils dz 50 0.74$          $        37.00 no bid $        37.00 
UNV-92000 UNIVERSAL Bent Scissors ea 50 1.39$          $        69.50 1.49$           $        74.50 
SPR86000 Sparco Staple Remover ea 100 0.37$          $        37.00 0.44$           $        44.00 
SWI74701 Swingline 747 Classic Stapler ea 40  $          8.79 $      351.60 8.99$           $      359.60 
UNV79000 UNIVERSAL Standard Staples bx 150 0.99$          $      148.50 1.85$           $      277.50 
MMM35006 3M Scotch 3500-6 Super Strength Sure Start Packaging Tape pk 30 14.99$        $      449.70 19.53$         $      585.90 
SPR64003 Sparco Economy Masking Tape pk 20  $          2.49 $        49.80 2.68$           $        53.60 
MMMC38BK 3M Scotch Desk C38 Tape Dispenser ea 100  $          1.59 $      159.00 1.68$           $      168.00 
MMM620034129
6 3M Highland Invisible Tape rl 160  $          0.49  $        78.40 0.55$            $        88.00 
MAX102211 Maxell 90 Minutes Communicator Series Audio Cassette ea 500 0.79$          $      395.00 0.80$           $      400.00 
SON3MC60 Sony 60 Minutes Microcassette pk 200 1.89$          $      378.00 2.65$           $      530.00 
WEV-CO125 WEVCO Park Recycled Business Envelopes bx 40 13.99$        $      559.60 14.33$         $      573.20 
QUAR1460 Quality Park Open-End Envelope bx 50  $        19.59 $      979.50 19.67$         $      983.50 
QUAR1580 Quality Park Open-End Envelope bx 50  $        21.99 $   1,099.50 22.26$         $   1,113.00 
PENP205A Pentel Sharp Automatic Pencil ea 150  $          2.19 $      328.50 2.27$           $      340.50 
FEL90658 Fellowes - CD Sleeve File ea 50 10.99$        $      549.50 11.99$         $      599.50 
COP813000 CAPITAL Manila File Folder bx 50 5.39$          $      269.50 6.32$           $      316.00 
UNV16113 UNIVERSAL Manila File Folder bx 50 9.39$          $      469.50 9.97$           $      498.50 
UNV14113 UNIVERSAL Hanging Folder with Tabs bx 50 4.99$          $      249.50 5.85$           $      292.50 
SMD64220 Smead Standard Green Hanging Pocket bx 100 19.99$        $   1,999.00 22.31$         $   2,231.00 
SPRSP26 Sparco Hanging File Folder Frame ct 30  $          7.49 $      224.70 7.99$           $      239.70 
SPRSP36 Sparco Hanging File Folder Frame ct 30  $        11.49 $      344.70 11.99$         $      359.70 
AVE8366 Avery Dennison Filing Labels pk 100 9.99$          $      999.00 10.50$         $   1,050.00 
MMM559 3M Post-it Self-Stick Easel Pad ea 20  $        14.00 $      280.00 15.48$         $      309.60 
MMM560 3M Post-it Self-Stick Easel Pad ea 20  $        14.00 $      280.00 15.48$         $      309.60 
SAN73843 Sanford Bit Needle Point Rollerball Bit Pen ea 300  $          0.79 $      237.00 0.89$           $      267.00 
SAN73844 Sanford Bit Needle Point Rollerball Bit Pen ea 600  $          0.79 $      474.00 0.89$           $      534.00 
SAN73842 Sanford Bit Needle Point Rollerball Bit Pen ea 600  $          0.79 $      474.00 0.89$           $      534.00 

* Quantities are estimated only and used for comparison/evaluation purposes.
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SAN1734904 Sanford Vision Soft Grip Pen ea 500  $          0.89 $      445.00 0.94$           $      470.00 
SAN1734918 Sanford Vision Soft Grip Pen ea 500  $          0.89 $      445.00 0.94$           $      470.00 
AVE5711 AVERY, Binder, 1-inch, Clear View, White ea 48 0.99$          $        47.52 1.44$           $        69.12 
AVE05726 AVERY, Binder, 1-1/2-inch, Clear View, White ea 144  $          1.49 $      214.56 1.89$           $      272.16 
AVE05731 Wilson Jones, Binder, 2-inch, Clear View, White ea 72 1.89$          $      136.08 2.24$           $      161.28 
AVE05741 AVERY Binder, 3-inch, Clear View, White ea 72 2.59$          $      186.48 3.09$           $      222.48 
UNV20742 UNIVERSAL Binder, D-Ring, 1-inch, White ea 72 2.49$          $      179.28 3.92$           $      282.24 
UNV20746 UNIVERSAL Binder, D-Ring, 2-inch, White ea 288 2.99$          $      861.12 5.47$           $   1,575.36 
UNV20748 UNIVERSAL, Binder, D-Ring, 3-inch, White ea 144 3.59$          $      516.96 7.46$           $   1,074.24 
UNV20994 UNIVERSAL, Binder, D-Ring, 4-inch, White ea 96 5.99$          $      575.04 10.76$         $   1,032.96 
WEVCO888 Colombian Envelope Interdepartmental 100/bx bx 10 17.59$        $      175.90 25.60$         $      256.00 
MMM3318Y 3M Post-It Note 3” x 3” Yellow pk 300 7.99$          $   2,397.00 7.99$           $   2,397.00 
UNV35662 UNIVERSAL Post-It Note 1-1/2” x 2” Yellow pk 100 1.99$          $      199.00 3.54$           $      354.00 
UNV35672SCLS UNIVERSAL Post-It Note 3” x 5” Yellow pd 100  $          0.49 $        49.00 0.91$           $        91.00 
AVE11416 Avery Clear Label Dividers 5 tabs pk 40  $          2.49 $        99.60 2.66$           $      106.40 
IVR 50501 Canned Air, Dust Off ea 72  $          3.99 $      287.28 9.53$           $      686.16 

Estimated Annual Cost 51,278.31$ 61,542.69$

Capital Office Difference Ernie Morris
60% <4.9% 55.1%
55% <8.3% 46.7%
40% <11.8% 28.2%

50% <24.1% 25.9%
60% <37.1% 25.9%

< = In Favor of Capital Office

Printer Toner          
OEM

Recycled/Remanudactured

% DiscountDISCOUNT PERCENTAGES FOR NON-CORE ITEMS
Category                  

Non-Core items
Furntiure

Office Machines

* Quantities are estimated only and used for comparison/evaluation purposes.



PRINTER CARTRIDGE
PRICE COMPARISON CHART
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50% OFF 

 Total cost based 
on 1 per machine 

 Ernie Morris 
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Discount

25.9% OFF 
 Total cost based 
on 1 per machine Reman. No.
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 REMAN 
CAPITAL 

PRICE 60% 
OFF 

Extended 
Reman. Cost

1 C6656A H.P. 5850 26.45$           13.23$              13.23$                  19.60$              19.60$                  ELI75229 20.99$            8.40$             8.40$                 
1 C9720A H.P. LASER JET 4600DN 227.00$         113.50$             113.50$                 168.21$            168.21$                ELI75055 178.49$          71.40$           71.40$               
2 C9720A LASER JET 4650 227.05$         113.53$             227.05$                168.24$            336.49$                ELI75055 133.86$          53.54$           107.09$             
3 Q5950A LASER JET 4700 260.40$         130.20$             390.60$                192.96$            578.87$                ELI 75187       209.99$          84.00$           251.99$             
6 C9730A LASER JET 5500DTN 328.34$         164.17$             985.02$                243.30$            1,459.80$             ELI 75144       265.99$          106.40$         638.38$             
1 C7115A DESK JET 1220 90.15$           45.08$              45.08$                  66.80$              66.80$                  ELI 70328       77.87$            31.15$            31.15$               
1 Q2612A DESKJET 3845 102.40$         51.20$              51.20$                  75.88$              75.88$                  ELI 75101       82.89$            33.16$           33.16$               
1 C9362WN DESK JET 5440 18.37$           9.19$                9.19$                    13.61$              13.61$                  ELI 75303       15.99$            6.40$             6.40$                 
4 C6656AN DESK LET 5550 26.45$           13.23$              52.90$                  19.60$              78.40$                  ELI 75229       20.99$            8.40$             33.58$               
1 C6656AN DESK JET 5650 26.45$           13.23$              13.23$                  19.60$              19.60$                  ELI 75229       20.99$            8.40$             8.40$                 
2 C6657AN DESK JET 5650 COLOR 43.42$           21.71$               43.42$                  32.17$              64.35$                  ELI 75230       33.99$            13.60$           27.19$               
8 C9364WN DESK JET 5940 26.45$           13.23$              105.80$                19.60$              156.80$                ELI 75304       20.99$            8.40$             67.17$               
1 C6578DN DESK JET 6122 43.42$           21.71$               21.71$                  32.17$              32.17$                  ELI 75225       33.99$            13.60$           13.60$               
2 C8767WN DESK JET 6540 38.45$           19.23$              38.45$                  28.49$              56.98$                  ELI 75249       30.99$            12.40$           24.79$               
1 C8767WN DESK JET6940 38 45$ 19 23$ 19 23$ 28 49$ 28 49$ ELI 75249 30 99$ 12 40$ 12 40$1 C8767WN DESK JET6940 38.45$          19.23$             19.23$                 28.49$             28.49$                  ELI 75249       30.99$           12.40$          12.40$              
1 51645A DESK JET 722C 38.67$           19.34$              19.34$                  28.65$              28.65$                  ELI 75220       31.49$            12.60$           12.60$               
1 C6615DN DESK JET 842C 36.56$           18.28$              18.28$                  27.09$              27.09$                  ELI 75227       29.69$            11.88$            11.88$               
2 51645A DESK JET 932C 38.67$           19.34$              38.67$                  28.65$              57.31$                  ELI 75220       31.49$            12.60$           25.19$               
3 C6615DN DESK JET 940C 36.56$           18.28$              54.84$                  27.09$              81.27$                  ELI 75227       29.69$            11.88$            35.63$               
1 51645A DESK JET960C 38.67$           19.34$              19.34$                  28.65$              28.65$                  ELI 75220       31.49$            12.60$           12.60$               
2 51645A DESK JET970C 38.67$           19.34$              38.67$                  28.65$              57.31$                  ELI 75220       31.49$            12.60$           25.19$               
1 C8767WN INKJET 6940 38.45$           19.23$              19.23$                  28.49$              28.49$                  ELI 75249       30.99$            12.40$           12.40$               
1 Q2612A H.P. LASER JET  1020 102.40$         51.20$              51.20$                  75.88$              75.88$                  ELI 75101       82.89$            33.16$           33.16$               
27 C4092A H.P. LASER JET  1100 90.75$           45.38$              1,225.13$              67.25$              1,815.64$             ELI 70308       74.99$            30.00$           809.89$             
1 C7115A H.P. LASER JET  1200 90.15$           45.08$              45.08$                  66.80$              66.80$                  ELI 70328       77.87$            31.15$            31.15$               
29 C7115A H.P. LASER JET  1200SE 90.15$           45.08$              1,307.18$              66.80$              1,937.23$             ELI 70328       77.87$            31.15$            903.29$             
16 Q2613A H.P. LASER JET  1300 104.62$         52.31$              836.96$                77.52$              1,240.37$             ELI 75102       89.99$            36.00$           575.94$             
5 Q5949A H.P. LASER JET  1320 104.62$         52.31$              261.55$                77.52$              387.62$                ELI 75110       84.99$            34.00$           169.98$             
4 Q5949A H.P. LASER JET  1320N 104.62$         52.31$              209.24$                77.52$              310.09$                ELI 75110       84.99$            34.00$           135.98$             
2 Q6511A H.P. LASER JET  2430TN 181.42$         90.71$              181.42$                 134.43$            268.86$                ELI 75111       146.99$          58.80$           117.59$             
1 Q2612A H.P. LASER JET  3030 102.40$         51.20$              51.20$                  75.88$              75.88$                  ELI 75101       82.89$            33.16$           33.16$               
2 Q2612A H.P. LASER JET  3055 102.40$         51.20$              102.40$                75.88$              151.76$                ELI 75101       82.89$            33.16$           66.31$               
3 Q5949A H.P. LASER JET  3390 104.62$         52.31$              156.93$                77.52$              232.57$                ELI 75110       84.99$            34.00$           101.99$             
2 C4127A H.P. LASER JET  4000 145.69$         72.85$              145.69$                107.96$            215.91$                ELI 75054       125.99$          50.40$           100.79$             
1 C4127A H.P. LASER JET  4050 145.69$         72.85$              72.85$                  107.96$            107.96$                ELI 75054       125.99$          50.40$           50.40$               
2 C8061A H.P. LASER JET  4100 145.80$         72.90$              145.80$                108.04$            216.08$                ELI 70330       125.99$          50.40$           100.79$             
1 Q5942A H.P. LASER JET  4250 218.15$         109.08$             109.08$                161.65$            161.65$                ELI 75109       176.59$          70.64$           70.64$               
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1 Q1339A H.P. LASER JET  4300 298.28$         149.14$             149.14$                 221.03$            221.03$                ELI 75060       257.99$          103.20$         103.20$             
2 C9730A H.P. LASER JET  5550DTN 328.34$         164.17$             328.34$                243.30$            486.60$                ELI 75144       265.99$          106.40$         212.79$             
11 C3906A H.P. LASER JET  6L 104.40$         52.20$              574.20$                77.36$              850.96$                -$              -$                  
1 C4182X H.P. LASER JET  8150 276.02$         138.01$             138.01$                 204.53$            204.53$                -$              -$                  
1 C8543X H.P. LASER JET  9000DN 404.02$         202.01$             202.01$                299.38$            299.38$                -$              -$                  
2 C8543X H.P. LASER JET  9000HNS 404.02$         202.01$             404.02$                299.38$            598.76$                -$              -$                  
4 C8727A H.P. LASER JET 2727 ALL IN O 23.27$           11.64$               46.54$                  17.24$              68.97$                  -$              -$                  
1 Q7553A H.P. LASER JET P2015X 117.98$         58.99$              58.99$                  87.42$              87.42$                  -$              -$                  

9,140.88$       13,546.78$     5,087.58$    
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